
ARAB TIMES, TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 10, 2015

30

Drinking problem?: You are no longer
alone! Confidential helpline 99641389.

❑        ❑        ❑

Narcotics Anonymous: NA can help
with addiction problems. Totally confi-
dential: 94087800 English/Arabic.

❑        ❑        ❑

Cancer online support group: If
you are Cancer patient or family mem-
ber fighting with this deadly disease,
come join our online support group.
Best way of dealing with this disease is
providing support and share our experi-
ence with each other. There are lot of
things which even doctors can’t tell so
be member of this website and start
sharing your experiences which may
help others. October is recognized as
National Breast Cancer Awareness
Month (NBCAM). The primary purpose
is to promote self examination and
screening mammography as the most
effective way to save lives by detecting
breast cancer at early stage. For more
information visit: http://fightingwith-
cancer.webs.com/
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Concours D’Elegance 2015: For car
aficionados there’s nothing like seeing
rare antique cars in motion with sights &
sounds teleporting them back in time.
Now you can enjoy all the nostalgia and
thrills once again during the fourth
Kuwait Concours D’Elegance classic car
competition on February 11-18, 2015
organized by the Historical, Vintage &

Classic Car Museum in Kuwait under
patronage of H.H Sheikh Nasser Al-
Mohammed Al-Ahmed Al-Sabah.

Below is the calendar of events of the
Kuwait Concours D’Elegance 2015: 

Wednesday: Feb 11; 13:00-18:00:
Governmental Classic Cars Event

19:00: Official Opening, Kuwait
Concours d’Elegance 2015

Thursday: Feb 12; 10:00-13:00:
American Sports Classic Cars Judging

12:00-15:00: Welcome to Gas Monkey
Garage Team

11:00-19:00: Kuwait Motorcycle
Festival

Friday: Feb 13; 10:00 - 16:00:
Participating Classic Cars Judging

11:00-19:00: Super Cars Event
Saturday: Feb 14; 9:00-13:00: Classic

and Sports Festival
11:00-12:00: Grand Tour, parade of

Classic Cars from the Marina Crescent to
Kuwait Towers returning to the Marina
Crescent

13:00-14:00: parade of Participating
Classic Cars and the Announcement of
Winners from All Categories

15:00-18:00: Ferrari Festival
20:00-22:00: Ceremony and Awards

Presentation 
Sunday: Feb 15; 9:00-21:00: Continue

Showing Classic Cars and the Winning
Car

11:00-19:00: Chevrolet Knights Event
Monday: Feb 16; 9:00-21:00: Continue

Showing the Classic Cars and the
Winning Car.

11:00-19:00: The 4 x4 Event
Tuesday: Feb 17; 9:00-21:00: Continue

Showing the Classic Cars and the
Winning Car.

11:00-19:00: Japanese Cars Event
Wednesday: Feb 18; 9:00-21:00:

Continue Showing the Classic Cars and
the Winning Car.

11:00-19:00: MOPAR Cars Event
❑        ❑        ❑

YMCA ecumenical bible quiz:
YMCA Kuwait is conducting the 3rd
Annual Bible Quiz for members from all
the churches in Kuwait on  Feb 11, 2015
at Light House, NECK from 6:30pm
onwards. The section of the Bible based
on which the quiz is going to be held is,
all Chapters from the Judges,
Deuteronomy, St Mathew and Acts of
Apostles. The first three winners will be
presented with ever rolling trophies and
Certificates. Last date of Registration is
1st February, 2015. For registration and
more enquiries please contact: Joseph
M.A. (Convener) Mob # 66843917,
Parimanam Manoj (General Secretary)
Mob # 97542985. 

❑        ❑        ❑

New Pictorialism at JAMM:
JAMM Art Gallery will present New
Pictorialism: Three Visions — Three
Photographers, a group exhibition
curated by Katya Traboulsi, featuring
photographs by Ali Azarmi, Danielle
Rizkallah and Vivian van Blerk, and
paying homage to pictorialism and the
very origins of photography where the
precise, objective reality promised by
photography has always had to co-exist
with the subjective perceptions of the
human being holding the camera.

The aim of the pictorialists, a move-
ment that gained influence after 1885, was
to obtain the recognition of photography
as an artistic medium. To achieve this,
photographers suppressed all that
appeared too scientific in photography in
favour of an aesthetic, plastic and subjec-
tive expression. Photography, until then
seen as an expression of pure verifiable
reality, was to be transformed into an art
form representing personal visions.

New Pictorialism: Three Visions —
Three Photographers will run from Feb 12
to March 5, 2015 with a private viewing
on Wednesday, Feb 11 from 6-9 pm.

Writers’ Forum holds another evening to reminisce

The evening of essay, short story,
poetry and verse, celebrated by the
Writers’ Forum, Kuwait, on Jan 30,
2015, at the residence of Rajesh
Verlekar, was graced with several
moments of celebration. The meeting
was presided over by Mohan Singh,
and a well-known Hindi-Urdu poet —
Tajwer Sultana was requested to be
the Chief Guest for the evening.
Rajesh Verlekar, the General
Secretary of the Forum, conducted the
proceedings. 

The first session began with the bud-
ding writer Sunil Sonsi reading a very
touching essay titled ‘Meri Vasihat’.
Noted Urdu short story writer and the
incumbent President of the Forum —

Dr Mirza Umair Begread a beautiful
story titled ‘Jehad-e-Hayat’. He also
informed the attendees about his new
website www.mirzaumairbeg.com
where most of his work is available for
reading in Urdu and a few of the works
in the Devnagari script as well.

In the second session, the other
members read out their latest creative
works in different Indian languages.
Those who read their poems included:
Sabir Galsulkar, Dr Muffazal Hussain,
Ibrahim Sange Raja in Urdu, and Vijay
Dhillon, Umesh Sharma, Gobind Rani
Sethi, and Dr Navniit Gandhi in Hindi.
Rajesh Verlekar recited in English and
Satya Narayan in Tamil. Towards the
conclusion of the program, the Chief

Guest — Tajwer Sultana, presented
her views about the creative expres-
sions of all present at the meeting and
also recited her poetry in Hindi. 

Mohan Singh then read out the
poetry of his daughter Parminder Kaur
in English who has been a member of
the Forum since her high-school and
gave the Presidential remarks.

Dr Sethi and Dr Wassem Siddiqi —
a renowned short story writer also
graced the occasion with their illustri-
ous presence. Dr Waseem Siddiqi’s
family also joined the Forum in relish-
ing an evening of poetry and prose.

The meeting concluded with every-
body thanking the hosts — Dr Navniit
Gandhi and Rajesh Verlekar.
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A photo from the event


